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Summary:
The Hating Game by Sally Thorne is a
romantic comedy about two co-workers,
Lucy Hutton and Joshua Templeman, who
are in a constant battle of wills. Lucy is a
bubbly, outgoing assistant at a publishing
house, while Joshua is her serious, uptight
boss. Despite their differences, they can't
help but be drawn to each other. As their
relationship develops, they must learn to
navigate their feelings and the office
politics that threaten to keep them apart. 

The novel begins with Lucy and Joshua's
first meeting. Lucy is immediately taken
with Joshua, but he is cold and distant. As
they work together, they engage in a game
of one-upmanship, trying to outdo each
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other in the office. Despite their animosity,
they can't help but be drawn to each other.

As their relationship develops, they must
learn to navigate their feelings and the
office politics that threaten to keep them
apart. Lucy is determined to prove herself
to her boss, while Joshua is determined to
keep his feelings for her hidden.
Meanwhile, their co-workers are
determined to keep them apart, as they
believe their relationship will be a
distraction from their work. 

The novel follows Lucy and Joshua as
they try to figure out their feelings for each
other and navigate the office politics. As
they grow closer, they must learn to trust
each other and open up about their
feelings. In the end, they must decide if
their relationship is worth the risk of losing
their jobs. 
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The Hating Game is a lighthearted
romantic comedy that follows Lucy and
Joshua as they navigate their feelings and
the office politics that threaten to keep
them apart. It is a story of love, friendship,
and learning to trust each other. It is a
charming and entertaining read that will
leave readers with a smile on their face.

Main ideas:
#1.      Lucy Hutton and Joshua
Templeman are co-workers at a
publishing house who have a
complicated relationship: they are both
competitive and ambitious, but also
have a strong attraction to each other. 

Lucy Hutton and Joshua Templeman are
co-workers at a publishing house who
have a complicated relationship. On the
surface, they are constantly competing
with each other, trying to outdo the other in
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their work. They are both ambitious and
driven, and they take great pride in their
accomplishments. However, beneath the
surface, there is a strong attraction
between them. They cant help but be
drawn to each other, even though they try
to deny it. They are both aware of the
tension between them, but neither of them
is willing to make the first move. They are
stuck in a cycle of competition and
attraction, and its unclear how it will all
end.

Their relationship is further complicated by
the fact that they are both in positions of
power at the publishing house. Lucy is the
assistant editor, while Joshua is the
editor-in-chief. This creates an additional
layer of tension between them, as they are
both vying for the same job. They are both
aware of the power dynamics at play, and
it adds an extra layer of complexity to their
relationship.
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Lucy and Joshuas relationship is a
complex one, and it is unclear how it will
all end. They are both ambitious and
driven, and they are both attracted to each
other. They are stuck in a cycle of
competition and attraction, and it is unclear
how it will all end. Will they be able to
overcome their differences and find a way
to be together, or will they remain stuck in
their cycle of competition and attraction?
Only time will tell.

#2.      Lucy is determined to prove her
worth to her boss, and she is willing to
do whatever it takes to get ahead, even
if it means competing with Joshua. 

Lucy Hutton is determined to prove her
worth to her boss, and she is willing to do
whatever it takes to get ahead. She is in a
constant battle with her co-worker, Joshua
Templeman, to prove who is the better
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employee. Lucy is determined to outshine
Joshua in every way, and she is willing to
go to great lengths to prove her worth. She
is willing to put in extra hours, take on
extra projects, and do whatever it takes to
get ahead. She is determined to show her
boss that she is the better employee, and
she is willing to do whatever it takes to
make that happen. 

Lucy and Joshuas competition is fierce,
and it is clear that neither of them is willing
to back down. They are both determined to
prove their worth to their boss, and they
are willing to do whatever it takes to get
ahead. They are constantly trying to
one-up each other, and they are both
determined to prove that they are the
better employee. Lucy is determined to
prove that she is the better employee, and
she is willing to do whatever it takes to
make that happen. 
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#3.      Joshua is a perfectionist who is
used to getting his way, and he is
determined to win the battle of wills
with Lucy. 

Joshua Templeman is a man who is used
to getting his way. He is a perfectionist
who is driven to succeed and is not afraid
to put in the hard work to make it happen.
He is determined to win the battle of wills
with Lucy Hutton, his rival at the office. He
is not afraid to push the boundaries and
challenge her in order to get what he
wants. He is confident in his abilities and is
not afraid to take risks in order to get the
upper hand. He is a formidable opponent
and will not back down until he has
achieved his goal. He is a man who is
used to getting his way and will not be
deterred by any obstacle in his path. 

Lucy Hutton is no match for Joshuas
determination and drive. She is a woman
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who is used to getting her way, but she is
not as confident as Joshua. She is not as
willing to take risks and is more likely to
back down when faced with a challenge.
She is not as driven as Joshua and is
more likely to take the easy way out. She
is not as determined to win the battle of
wills with Joshua and is more likely to give
in to his demands. She is a woman who is
used to getting her way, but she is not as
strong-willed as Joshua and is more likely
to give in to his demands. 

The battle of wills between Joshua and
Lucy is a classic example of two
strong-willed individuals vying for control.
Joshua is determined to win and will not
back down until he has achieved his goal.
Lucy is not as determined and is more
likely to give in to Joshuas demands. It will
be interesting to see who will come out on
top in this battle of wills. Will Joshuas
determination and drive be enough to win
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the battle, or will Lucys more laid-back
approach be enough to get her what she
wants? 

#4.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is complicated by their mutual
attraction, and they must learn to
navigate their feelings while still
competing against each other. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is a
complex one. On the one hand, they are
fierce competitors in the workplace, always
trying to outdo each other. On the other
hand, they cant deny the strong attraction
they feel for each other. This creates a
difficult situation for them, as they must
learn to balance their feelings with their
professional rivalry. 

The two of them must learn to navigate
their relationship carefully, as it could
easily become a distraction from their
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work. They must also learn to trust each
other, as their feelings could easily be
used against them in the workplace. It is a
delicate balance, but one that they must
learn to master if they are to succeed in
their professional lives. 

The Hating Game by Sally Thorne is a
story of two people learning to navigate
their complicated relationship while still
competing against each other. It is a story
of love, rivalry, and learning to trust each
other in the face of adversity. It is a story
of two people learning to find a balance
between their feelings and their
professional lives. 

#5.      Lucy and Joshua's rivalry is
further complicated by the fact that
they are both vying for the same
promotion. 

Lucy and Joshuas rivalry is more than just
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a professional competition. Its a personal
battle of wits and wills, with each of them
determined to outdo the other. As they
both strive for the same promotion, the
stakes are higher than ever. They are
constantly trying to one-up each other,
whether its in the boardroom or in the
office. They are both fiercely competitive
and will do whatever it takes to get ahead. 

The tension between them is palpable,
and it only intensifies as they both vie for
the same promotion. They are both
determined to prove themselves and show
that they are the best candidate for the job.
As the competition heats up, they become
more and more determined to outdo each
other. Its a battle of wits and wills, and
neither of them is willing to back down. 

The rivalry between Lucy and Joshua is
further complicated by the fact that they
are both vying for the same promotion. Its
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a high-stakes competition, and neither of
them is willing to give up. As they both
strive to prove themselves and outdo each
other, the tension between them only
grows. Its a battle of wits and wills, and the
outcome is uncertain. 

#6.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both hiding secrets from each
other. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
keeping secrets from each other. Lucy is
hiding her true feelings for Joshua, while
Joshua is hiding his past. Lucy is afraid to
let her guard down and open up to Joshua,
knowing that he could reject her if he knew
the truth. Meanwhile, Joshua is afraid to
tell Lucy about his past, knowing that she
could judge him for it. This creates a
tension between them that is difficult to
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overcome.

The secrets they are keeping from each
other create a barrier between them that is
hard to break down. They are both afraid
to be vulnerable and open up to each
other, so they keep their secrets hidden.
This makes it difficult for them to build a
strong connection and trust each other.
They are both aware of the secrets they
are keeping, and it creates a sense of
unease between them that is hard to
ignore.

The secrets they are keeping from each
other add an extra layer of complexity to
their relationship. They are both afraid to
take the risk of revealing their secrets, and
this makes it difficult for them to move
forward in their relationship. They are both
aware of the secrets they are keeping, and
it creates a sense of unease between
them that is hard to ignore.
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#7.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
hearts from getting hurt. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their hearts from getting
hurt. Lucy has been hurt in the past and is
wary of getting too close to anyone, while
Joshua is still trying to get over his
ex-girlfriend. Both of them are afraid of
getting too attached and having their
hearts broken again. They both know that
if they let their guard down, they could be
vulnerable to getting hurt. 

At the same time, they are both drawn to
each other and cant help but feel a
connection. They both want to explore the
possibility of a relationship, but they are
both scared of the potential
consequences. They are both trying to find
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a balance between protecting their hearts
and allowing themselves to open up to the
possibility of love. 

The tension between them is palpable,
and its clear that they both want to take
the next step but are afraid of the potential
consequences. They are both trying to
navigate their feelings and find a way to
make it work without getting hurt. Its a
delicate balance, and its clear that they
both need to take it slow and be careful
with each others hearts. 

#8.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
reputations from being damaged. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they both have
a lot to lose if their reputations are
damaged. Lucy is a rising star in the
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company, and shes worked hard to get to
where she is. She doesnt want to risk her
career by getting too close to her boss. On
the other hand, Joshua is the CEO of the
company and he has a lot of responsibility.
He doesnt want to be seen as someone
who is taking advantage of his position. 

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
palpable, and its clear that they both want
to protect their reputations. They are both
aware of the consequences of their
actions, and they are both trying to be
careful. They are both trying to maintain a
professional relationship, but its clear that
there is something more between them.
They are both trying to keep their feelings
in check, but its becoming increasingly
difficult. 

The situation is further complicated by the
fact that they are both trying to protect
their reputations. They are both aware of
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the potential consequences of their
actions, and they are both trying to be
careful. They are both trying to maintain a
professional relationship, but its clear that
there is something more between them.
They are both trying to keep their feelings
in check, but its becoming increasingly
difficult. 

#9.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
careers from being derailed. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their careers from being
derailed. Lucy is a rising star at the
company, and Joshua is the head of the
department. Both of them are ambitious
and driven, and they know that any hint of
a romantic relationship between them
could be seen as unprofessional and could
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damage their reputations. They are both
aware of the risks, but they cant seem to
stay away from each other.

The stakes are even higher for Lucy, as
she is a woman in a male-dominated
industry. She knows that any hint of
impropriety could be used against her, and
she is determined to protect her career.
Joshua is also aware of the risks, but he is
more willing to take them. He is confident
in his abilities and believes that he can
handle any fallout from a potential
relationship.

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
palpable, and it only increases as they try
to navigate their feelings for each other
while also protecting their careers. They
are both aware of the risks, but they cant
seem to stay away from each other. Its a
delicate balancing act, and its clear that
their relationship is further complicated by
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the fact that they are both trying to protect
their careers from being derailed.

#10.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
families from being hurt. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they both have
a vested interest in protecting their families
from being hurt. Lucy is trying to protect
her family from the potential fallout of her
relationship with Joshua, while Joshua is
trying to protect his family from the
potential consequences of his own actions.
Both of them are trying to do the right
thing, but their efforts are often at odds
with each other. This creates a tension
between them that is both frustrating and
exciting, as they both try to navigate their
way through the complexities of their
relationship.
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At the same time, they are both aware that
their families are important to them and
that they need to protect them from any
potential harm. This creates a unique
dynamic between them, as they both try to
balance their own needs with the needs of
their families. As they struggle to find a
way to make their relationship work, they
must also find a way to protect their
families from any potential harm. This
creates a unique challenge for them, as
they must find a way to make their
relationship work while also protecting
their families.

Ultimately, Lucy and Joshuas relationship
is further complicated by the fact that they
are both trying to protect their families from
being hurt. This creates a unique dynamic
between them, as they must find a way to
make their relationship work while also
protecting their families. As they navigate
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their way through the complexities of their
relationship, they must also find a way to
protect their families from any potential
harm. This creates a unique challenge for
them, as they must find a way to make
their relationship work while also
protecting their families.

#11.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
dreams from being crushed. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their dreams from being
crushed. Lucy is determined to prove
herself in her new job and make a name
for herself in the corporate world, while
Joshua is trying to protect his dream of
becoming a successful CEO. Both of them
are fiercely competitive and have a
deep-seated fear of failure, which makes it
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difficult for them to trust each other. They
are constantly trying to outdo each other,
and this creates a lot of tension between
them. At the same time, they are both
drawn to each other, and they cant help
but feel a connection. They are both trying
to protect their dreams, but they are also
trying to protect their hearts.

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
further complicated by the fact that they
are both trying to protect their dreams from
being crushed. They both want to succeed
in their respective fields, but they are also
afraid of failure. This fear of failure makes
it difficult for them to trust each other, and
it creates a lot of tension between them.
They are both fiercely competitive, and
they cant help but feel a connection. They
are both trying to protect their dreams, but
they are also trying to protect their hearts.

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
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further complicated by the fact that they
are both trying to protect their dreams from
being crushed. They both want to succeed
in their respective fields, but they are also
afraid of failure. This fear of failure makes
it difficult for them to trust each other, and
it creates a lot of tension between them.
They are both fiercely competitive, and
they cant help but feel a connection. They
are both trying to protect their dreams, but
they are also trying to protect their hearts
from being broken.

#12.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
pride from being damaged. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they both have
a lot of pride and are trying to protect it.
They both want to be seen as strong and
capable, and they dont want to be seen as
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vulnerable or weak. This leads to a lot of
tension between them, as they both try to
outdo each other in order to prove their
worth. They are constantly trying to one-up
each other, and this makes it difficult for
them to truly connect and build a
meaningful relationship. 

At the same time, they both want to be
seen as the better person in the
relationship. They both want to be the one
who is in control, and they dont want to be
seen as the one who is being taken
advantage of. This leads to a lot of power
struggles between them, as they both try
to assert their dominance over the other.
This makes it difficult for them to trust each
other and to be open and honest with each
other. 

Ultimately, Lucy and Joshuas relationship
is further complicated by the fact that they
are both trying to protect their pride from
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being damaged. They are both trying to
prove themselves to each other, and this
leads to a lot of tension and power
struggles between them. It makes it
difficult for them to truly connect and build
a meaningful relationship, and it makes it
difficult for them to trust each other and be
open and honest with each other. 

#13.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
egos from being bruised. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their egos from being
bruised. They are both fiercely competitive
and have a long history of trying to one-up
each other. This has led to a lot of tension
between them, as they are both trying to
prove that they are the better one. As a
result, they often find themselves in a
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power struggle, trying to outdo each other
in order to gain the upper hand. This can
lead to a lot of hurt feelings and
misunderstandings, as neither of them
wants to be seen as the weaker one.

At the same time, they both have a
deep-seated need to be respected and
admired by the other. This can lead to a lot
of insecurity and fear of rejection, as they
are both afraid of being seen as
inadequate. This can make it difficult for
them to open up and be vulnerable with
each other, as they are both afraid of
being judged or rejected. As a result, they
often find themselves in a cycle of trying to
protect their egos while also trying to build
a connection with each other.

Ultimately, Lucy and Joshuas relationship
is further complicated by the fact that they
are both trying to protect their egos from
being bruised. This can lead to a lot of
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tension and misunderstandings between
them, as they are both trying to prove that
they are the better one. At the same time,
they both have a deep-seated need to be
respected and admired by the other, which
can make it difficult for them to open up
and be vulnerable with each other. As a
result, they often find themselves in a
cycle of trying to protect their egos while
also trying to build a connection with each
other.

#14.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
reputations from being tarnished. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their reputations from
being tarnished. Lucy is a rising star in the
company, and she is determined to prove
her worth and make a name for herself.
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Joshua, on the other hand, is the
companys golden boy, and he is
determined to maintain his perfect image.
As a result, they are both constantly trying
to one-up each other in the office, while
also trying to keep their personal feelings
for each other hidden. This creates a
unique dynamic between them, as they
are both trying to protect their reputations
while also trying to figure out how to
navigate their feelings for each other.

The tension between them is further
heightened by the fact that they are both
aware of the potential consequences of
their relationship. If their relationship were
to become public, it could have a negative
impact on their careers. As a result, they
are both constantly trying to keep their
relationship a secret, while also trying to
figure out how to express their feelings for
each other. This creates a unique
challenge for them, as they are both trying
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to protect their reputations while also trying
to figure out how to express their feelings
for each other.

#15.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
secrets from being revealed. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they both have
secrets they are trying to protect. Lucy is
trying to keep her past a secret, while
Joshua is trying to keep his true feelings
for her hidden. Both of them are afraid of
what will happen if their secrets are
revealed, and this fear creates a tension
between them that makes it difficult for
them to be honest with each other. As they
get closer, they both become more and
more aware of the secrets they are
keeping from each other, and this creates
a barrier between them that they must
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overcome if they are to have any chance
of a successful relationship.

The secrets they are keeping from each
other also add an element of mystery to
their relationship. They both want to know
more about each other, but they are afraid
of what they might find out. This creates a
sense of anticipation and excitement as
they get closer, as they both wonder what
the other is hiding. As they get closer, they
also become more aware of the risks they
are taking by revealing their secrets, and
this adds an extra layer of complexity to
their relationship.

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their secrets from being
revealed. This creates a tension between
them that can be both exciting and
frustrating, as they both try to navigate
their way through the complexities of their
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relationship. As they get closer, they must
learn to trust each other and be honest
with each other if they are to have any
chance of a successful relationship.

#16.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
vulnerabilities from being exposed. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they both have
a lot to hide. They are both fiercely
independent and have built walls around
themselves to protect their vulnerabilities.
They are both afraid of being exposed and
judged, so they keep their true feelings
hidden. This makes it difficult for them to
trust each other and to open up to one
another. They are both constantly trying to
outwit each other, and this makes it hard
for them to form a genuine connection.
They are both so guarded that it is difficult
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for them to let their guard down and be
vulnerable with each other. 

The tension between them is palpable,
and it is clear that they are both struggling
to find a way to connect. They are both
trying to protect themselves from being
hurt, and this makes it difficult for them to
take a risk and open up to each other.
They are both so afraid of being vulnerable
that it is hard for them to take the first step
and trust each other. They are both so
guarded that it is difficult for them to let
their guard down and be vulnerable with
each other. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their vulnerabilities from
being exposed. They are both so afraid of
being hurt that it is hard for them to take a
risk and open up to each other. They are
both so guarded that it is difficult for them
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to let their guard down and be vulnerable
with each other. This makes it difficult for
them to form a genuine connection and to
trust each other. 

#17.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
hearts from being broken. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their hearts from being
broken. Lucy is determined to keep her
heart safe from the pain of a broken
relationship, while Joshua is trying to
protect himself from the pain of a failed
relationship. Both of them are trying to
keep their hearts safe from the potential
hurt that could come from a relationship,
but they cant help but be drawn to each
other. Despite their best efforts, they cant
seem to stay away from each other, and
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their feelings for each other continue to
grow. 

The tension between them is palpable,
and it only intensifies as they try to keep
their feelings hidden. They both know that
if they let their guard down, they could be
hurt, and so they continue to keep their
distance. But as they continue to work
together, they find themselves drawn to
each other more and more, and they cant
help but wonder if they could have
something real. 

The complicated nature of their
relationship only adds to the tension
between them, and it makes it even harder
for them to keep their feelings hidden.
They both know that if they let their guard
down, they could be hurt, and so they
continue to keep their distance. But as
they continue to work together, they find
themselves drawn to each other more and
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more, and they cant help but wonder if
they could have something real.

#18.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
dreams from being shattered. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their dreams from being
shattered. Lucy has worked hard to
become the executive assistant to the
CEO of a major publishing company, and
she is determined to prove her worth and
rise to the top. Joshua, on the other hand,
is trying to protect his dream of becoming
a successful author. He is determined to
make it in the publishing world, and he is
afraid that if he gets too close to Lucy, his
dream will be ruined. 

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
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palpable, and it is further complicated by
the fact that they are both trying to protect
their dreams. They are both fiercely
independent and determined to make it in
their respective fields, and they are both
afraid of letting their guard down and
risking their dreams. As they continue to
work together, they must find a way to
navigate their complicated relationship and
protect their dreams at the same time.

#19.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
hopes from being dashed. 

Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their hopes from being
dashed. Lucy has been harboring a secret
crush on Joshua for years, but shes afraid
to let her feelings show in case he doesnt
feel the same way. Meanwhile, Joshua is
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trying to keep his own feelings in check, as
hes not sure if Lucy is ready to take their
relationship to the next level. Both of them
are trying to protect their hearts from being
broken, and this makes their relationship
even more complicated.

The tension between them is palpable,
and its clear that they both want something
more from each other. But theyre both too
scared to take the plunge and risk getting
hurt. Theyre both trying to protect their
hopes from being dashed, and this makes
it difficult for them to move forward in their
relationship. Its a delicate balance, and its
up to them to decide if theyre willing to
take the risk and open up to each other.

#20.      Lucy and Joshua's relationship
is further complicated by the fact that
they are both trying to protect their
futures from being ruined.
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Lucy and Joshuas relationship is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their futures from being
ruined. Lucy is determined to prove herself
in her new job and is determined to make
a name for herself in the corporate world.
She is also trying to protect her heart from
being broken by Joshua, who she is
attracted to but is also her rival.
Meanwhile, Joshua is trying to protect his
career from being derailed by Lucy, who
he is also attracted to. He is also trying to
protect his heart from being broken by
Lucy, who he is determined to beat in the
corporate game. Both of them are trying to
protect their futures, but their feelings for
each other are making it difficult for them
to stay focused on their goals.

The tension between Lucy and Joshua is
palpable, and it is clear that they are both
struggling to keep their feelings in check.
They are both trying to protect their
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futures, but their feelings for each other
are making it difficult for them to stay
focused on their goals. They are both
trying to protect their hearts from being
broken, but they are also both trying to
protect their careers from being derailed
by the other. It is a delicate balance that
they must maintain, and it is further
complicated by the fact that they are both
trying to protect their futures from being
ruined.

Thank you for reading!

If you enjoyed this abstract, please share it
with your friends.
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